
CITY OF BOWLING GREEN
PROJECT NAME: Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation - Various Locations
BID DATE: February 12, 2010 Miller Pipeline Corporation Reynolds Inliner, LLC Kokosing Construction Company, LLC

Published Construction Estimate  =  $240,000 8850 Crawfordsville Rd. 4143 Weaver Court PO Box 226

Indianapolis, IN 46234 Hilliard, OH 43026 Fredericktown, OH 43019

BID ODOT UNIT   ITEM UNIT   ITEM UNIT   ITEM

ITEM REF. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE   TOTAL PRICE   TOTAL PRICE   TOTAL

NO. NO. BID BID BID BID BID BID

1a SP 8-inch CIPP Pipeline Rehabilitation 6065 LF 27.00$              163,755.00$    36.00$              218,340.00$    23.80$              144,347.00$    

1b SP 10-inch CIPP Pipeline Rehabilitation 340 LF 28.50$              9,690.00$         37.00$              12,580.00$       24.00$              8,160.00$         

1c SP Service Connection Reinstated 205 EA 125.00$            25,625.00$       25.00$              5,125.00$         170.00$            34,850.00$       

2a 603 Pipe Sewer Repair 10" Diameter and Smaller, Type B 40 LF 370.00$            14,800.00$       325.00$            13,000.00$       322.00$            12,880.00$       

2b 603 Pipe Sewer Repair 10" Diameter and Smaller, Type C 100 LF 205.00$            20,500.00$       275.00$            27,500.00$       200.00$            20,000.00$       

3a 659 Seeding, Mulching and Top Soil 470 SY 4.75$                2,232.50$         8.00$                3,760.00$         4.00$                1,880.00$         

4a 614 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS 2,000.00$         2,000.00$         2,500.00$         2,500.00$         100.00$            100.00$            

Base Bid Total 238,602.50$    282,805.00$    222,217.00$    

5a-Alt SP 8-inch Fold and Form Pipeline Rehabilitation 6065 LF 22.50$              136,462.50$    33.00$              200,145.00$    No Bid No Bid

5b-Alt SP 10-inch Fold and Form Pipeline Rehabilitation 340 LF 25.00$              8,500.00$         37.00$              12,580.00$       No Bid No Bid

5c-Alt SP Service Connection Reinstated 205 EA 125.00$            25,625.00$       25.00$              5,125.00$         No Bid No Bid

Alternate Bid Total 170,587.50$    217,850.00$    -$                  

Credit for Non-Award of Items 1a, 1b and 1c (199,070.00)$   (236,045.00)$   (187,357.00)$   

Bid with Alternates 210,120.00$    264,610.00$    No Bid

TOTAL BID 210,120.00$    264,610.00$    No Bid

COMPLETION (days) 210 120 180

Lowest Bid 210,120.00$                                                                   

Award to Miller Pipeline Corporation
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CITY OF BOWLING GREEN
PROJECT NAME: Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation - Various Locations
BID DATE: February 12, 2010

Published Construction Estimate  =  $240,000

BID ODOT

ITEM REF. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT

NO. NO.

1a SP 8-inch CIPP Pipeline Rehabilitation 6065 LF

1b SP 10-inch CIPP Pipeline Rehabilitation 340 LF

1c SP Service Connection Reinstated 205 EA

2a 603 Pipe Sewer Repair 10" Diameter and Smaller, Type B 40 LF

2b 603 Pipe Sewer Repair 10" Diameter and Smaller, Type C 100 LF

3a 659 Seeding, Mulching and Top Soil 470 SY

4a 614 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS

Base Bid Total

5a-Alt SP 8-inch Fold and Form Pipeline Rehabilitation 6065 LF

5b-Alt SP 10-inch Fold and Form Pipeline Rehabilitation 340 LF

5c-Alt SP Service Connection Reinstated 205 EA

Alternate Bid Total

Credit for Non-Award of Items 1a, 1b and 1c

Bid with Alternates

TOTAL BID

COMPLETION (days)

Lowest Bid 210,120.00$                                                                   

Award to Miller Pipeline Corporation

United Survey, Inc. Insituform Technologies, Inc.

25145 Broadway Ave. 17988 Edison Avenue

Cleveland, OH 44146 Chesterfield, MO 63005

UNIT   ITEM UNIT   ITEM

PRICE   TOTAL PRICE   TOTAL

BID BID BID BID

28.50$              172,852.50$    23.90$              144,953.50$    

42.50$              14,450.00$       27.20$              9,248.00$         

50.00$              10,250.00$       195.00$            39,975.00$       

322.00$            12,880.00$       410.00$            16,400.00$       

200.00$            20,000.00$       515.00$            51,500.00$       

4.00$                1,880.00$         6.20$                2,914.00$         

500.00$            500.00$            7,725.00$         7,725.00$         

232,812.50$    272,715.50$    

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

-$                  -$                  

(197,552.50)$   (194,176.50)$   

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

120 180

Various Streets Sewer Relining Bid Tab Bid Tab 2 of 2 2/17/2010


