CITY OF BOWLING GREEN
PROJECTNAME:  Poe and Dunbridge Pump Station Replacement

BID DATE: February 25, 2010 Kirk Bros. Co. Edward Kelly and Sons
Published Construction Estimate = $975,000 11942 West US 224 5555 Woodville Road
Alvada, OH 44802 Northwood, OH 43619
BID OoDOT UNIT ITEM UNIT ITEM
ITEM REF. DESCRIPTION IQUANTITY] UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
NO. NO. BID BID BID BID
Base Bid Items
1a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, Eq 1 EA |$ 561,753.00 [ $ 561,753.00 [ $ 561,000.00 | $ 561,000.00
1b SP]10' x 10' Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA |$ 39,711.00($ 39,711.00 [$ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00
2a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station Abandonment 1 LS $ 2,333.00 | $ 2,333.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
3a 638]12" Dia. C-900 Sanitary Sewer Forcemain 1526 LF $ 4342 |$ 66,258.92 | $ 53.00 [ $ 80,878.00
3b SP]Connection of Forcemain to Grit Chamber 1 LS $ 977.00 | $ 977.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
3c SP|Termination of Existing 6" Forcemain 2 EA 1$ 1,288.50 | $ 2,577.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
4a 604|Wet Well Modifications 1 LS $ 8,699.00 | $ 8,699.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
4b 604]Sanitary Sewer Manhole, Type 3-4 1 EA |$ 2167.00|$ 2,167.00 | $  4,000.00 [ $  4,000.00
5a 203|Pavement Excavation 273 CY 1% 16.94 | $ 4,624.62 | $ 8.00($ 2,184.00
5b 203|Subgrade Compaction 545 SY |$ 392§ 2,136.40 | $ 200 ($ 1,090.00
5¢c 304|Aggregate Base 182 CY |$ 28.79 | $ 5,239.78 | $ 35.00 | $ 6,370.00
5d 301|Bituminous Aggregate Base 46 CYy 1% 167.60 | $ 7,709.60 | $ 160.00 | $  7,360.00
5e 448|Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course 23 CY |$ 17430 | $ 4,008.90 | $ 164.00 | $ 3,772.00
5f 448|Asphalt Concrete Surface Course 23 CYy 1% 189.96 | $ 4,369.08 | $ 175.00 | $§  4,025.00
59 407|Tack Coat 55 GAL | $ 224 $ 123.20 | $ 2.00$ 110.00
6a SP|4" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 520 LF $ 448 | $ 2,329.60 | $ 5.00($ 2,600.00
6b SP|4" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 460 | $ 115.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 150.00
6c SPJ2" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 580 LF $ 420($ 2,436.00 | $ 200 ($ 1,160.00
6d SP|2" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 432 $ 108.00 | $ 5.00 [ $ 125.00
7a 604]Catch Basins, Type 4-1 2 EA |$ 91750 [ $ 1,835.00 [$  2,500.00 | $  5,000.00
8a 603]12" Storm Sewer, Type B 40 LF $ 39.20 [ $ 1,568.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 2,000.00
8b 603] Connection to Existing Storm Sewer 1 LS $ 1,668.00 | $ 1,668.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 800.00
8c 603]30" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 10 LF $ 878.50 | $ 8,785.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 1,500.00
8d 603]8" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 72 LF $ 5299 | $ 3,815.28 | $ 55.00 [ $  3,960.00
8e 603]6" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 31 LF $ 7155 | $ 2,218.05 | $ 50.00 | $ 1,550.00
8f 603|4" Drain Pipe, Type B 40 LF $ 61.75($ 2,470.00 | $ 40.00 [ $ 1,600.00
8g 603|Field Tile Repair Smaller Than 12" 100 LF $ 1145 $ 1,145.00 | $ 8.00 [ $ 800.00
9a 659]Seeding and Mulching, Including Topsoil 3730 SY |$ 144 [ $ 5,371.20 | $ 200 ($ 7,460.00
10a SP|Flow Meter Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 34796.74|$ 34,796.74[$ 40,000.00 | $ 40,000.00
10b SP|Bypass Manhole Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 18,03400($ 18,034.00 [$ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
11a 616|Water for Dust Control 6 MGAL | $ 156.17 | $ 937.02 | $ 1.00 | $ 6.00
12a 607]Fence, Type CL with Barbed Wire 70 LF $ 3514 [ $ 2,459.80 | $ 30.00 [$  2,100.00
12b 607]Gate, Type CL with Barbed Wire 1 EA $ 1,244.00 | $ 1,244.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
12c SP]Removal of Existing Fence Type CL with Barbed Wirg 70 LF $ 716 | $ 501.20 | $ 12.00 | $ 840.00
13a 207|Silt Fence 460 LF $ 201 ($ 924.60 | $ 250 $ 1,150.00
13b 207]Inlet Protection 2 EA |$ 140.50 | $ 281.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 200.00
13b 207|Temporary Construction Drive 1 LS $ 2,433.00 | $ 2,433.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
14a SP|Wet Well Rehabilitated 1 EA |$ 1,564.00 | $ 1,564.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
14b SP]Manhole Rehabilitated 2 EA $ 2,793.50 | $ 5,587.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 6,600.00
15a SP|Vactor Receiving Station 1 EA |$ 23868.00|$% 23868.00|$% 17,000.00($ 17,000.00
15a SP]Pipe Bollard 2 EA $ 577.50 | $ 1,155.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00
16a 638]12-Inch Gate Valve and Box 3 EA |$ 209967 |$ 6,299.01 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 10,500.00
17a SP]Combination Air Valve and Manole 2 EA |$ 5,182.00 | $ 10,364.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 7,600.00
Base Bid Total $ 857,000.00 $ 863,390.00
Substitution Bid ltems
1a SP]Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, E 1 EA No Bid | $ - No Bid | $ -
1b SP|10' x 10' Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA No Bid | $ - No Bid | $ -
Substitution Bid Total $ - $ -
Credit for Non-Award of ltems Base Bid 1a and 1b| None None
Bid with Substitution None None
TOTAL BID $ 857,000.00 $ 863,390.00
COMPLETION (days) 275 270
Lowest Bid $ 857,000.00
Award to Kirk Bros. Co.
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CITY OF BOWLING GREEN
PROJECTNAME:  Poe and Dunbridge Pump Station Replacement

BID DATE: February 25, 2010 B. Hill'z Excavating, Inc. Anderzack-Pitzen
Published Construction Estimate = $975,000 8085 McCutchenville Road 424 East Main St.
Wayne, OH 43466 Metamora, OH 43540
BID OoDOT UNIT ITEM UNIT ITEM
ITEM REF. DESCRIPTION IQUANTITY] UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
NO. NO. BID BID BID BID
Base Bid Items
1a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, Eq 1 EA | $ 594,335.00 [ $ 594,335.00 | $ 561,228.00 [ $ 561,228.00
1b SP]10' x 10" Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA |$ 2540000 |$ 25400.00|$% 28,000.00($ 28,000.00
2a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station Abandonment 1 LS $ 4,800.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
3a 638]12" Dia. C-900 Sanitary Sewer Forcemain 1526 LF $ 35.00 | $§ 53,410.00 | $ 59.00 [ $ 90,034.00
3b SP]Connection of Forcemain to Grit Chamber 1 LS $ 1,250.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
3c SP|Termination of Existing 6" Forcemain 2 EA 1$ 350.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,800.00
4a 604 Wet Well Modifications 1 LS $ 14,600.00 [$ 14,600.00 |$ 12,000.00 [ $ 12,000.00
4b 604]Sanitary Sewer Manhole, Type 3-4 1 EA |$ 205000|$ 2,050.00($ 2500.00$ 2500.00
5a 203|Pavement Excavation 273 CY 1% 18.00 | $ 4,914.00 | $ 20.00 [ $ 5,460.00
5b 203|Subgrade Compaction 545 SY |$ 200 ($ 1,090.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 545.00
5c 304|Aggregate Base 182 CY $ 38.00 | $ 6,916.00 | $ 55.00 [ $ 10,010.00
5d 301|Bituminous Aggregate Base 46 CYy 1% 152.00 | $§  6,992.00 | $ 150.00 | $§  6,900.00
5e 448|Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course 23 CY |$ 158.00 | $ 3,634.00 | $ 156.00 | $ 3,588.00
5f 448|Asphalt Concrete Surface Course 23 CYy 1% 172.00 | $§  3,956.00 | $ 170.00 | $  3,910.00
59 407|Tack Coat 55 GAL | $ 2.00$ 110.00 | $ 2.00 | $ 110.00
6a SPJ4" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 520 LF $ 5.00|$ 2,600.00 | $ 500 |$  2,600.00
6b SP|4" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 10.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 150.00
6c SPJ2" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 580 LF $ 200 ($ 1,160.00 | $ 200 ($ 1,160.00
6d SP|2" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 10.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 4.00 [ $ 100.00
7a 604]Catch Basins, Type 4-1 2 EA |$ 725.00 [ $ 1,450.00 |$  1,500.00 [$  3,000.00
8a 603]12" Storm Sewer, Type B 40 LF $ 29.00 | $ 1,160.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 2,800.00
8b 603] Connection to Existing Storm Sewer 1 LS $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00
8c 603]30" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 10 LF $ 397.00 | $ 3,970.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 5,000.00
8d 603]8" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 72 LF |$ 42.00 [$  3,024.00 | $ 110.00 | $  7,920.00
8e 603]6" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 31 LF $ 40.00 | $ 1,240.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 4,650.00
8f 603|4" Drain Pipe, Type B 40 LF |$ 38.00($ 1,520.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 440.00
8g 603|Field Tile Repair Smaller Than 12" 100 LF $ 3.00$ 300.00 | $ 4.00 [ $ 400.00
9a 659] Seeding and Mulching, Including Topsoil 3730 SY 1% 1.00|$ 3,730.00 | $ 150 |$  5,595.00
10a SP|Flow Meter Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 39,150.00 [$ 39,150.00 | $ 35,000.00 [ $ 35,000.00
10b SP|Bypass Manhole Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 22,400.00 [$ 22,400.00|$ 20,000.00 [$ 20,000.00
11a 616|Water for Dust Control 6 MGAL | $ 10.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 60.00
12a 607]Fence, Type CL with Barbed Wire 70 LF |$ 30.00 [$ 2,100.00 | $ 30.00[$  2,100.00
12b 607]Gate, Type CL with Barbed Wire 1 EA $ 1,015.00 | $ 1,015.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
12c SPJRemoval of Existing Fence Type CL with Barbed Wirg 70 LF $ 13.00 | $ 910.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 840.00
13a 207|Silt Fence 460 LF $ 1.00 [ $ 460.00 | $ 1.00 [ $ 460.00
13b 207]Inlet Protection 2 EA |$ 85.00 [ $ 170.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 240.00
13b 207| Temporary Construction Drive 1 LS $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00
14a SP|Wet Well Rehabilitated 1 EA |$ 260000|$ 260000 ($ 1,400.00$  1,400.00
14b SP]Manhole Rehabilitated 2 EA $ 5,600.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 6,600.00
15a SP|Vactor Receiving Station 1 EA |$ 25550.00|$ 25550.00(¢$ 31,000.00|$ 31,000.00
15a SP]Pipe Bollard 2 EA $ 325.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 1,500.00
16a 638]12-Inch Gate Valve and Box 3 EA |$ 169800|$ 5094.00($ 1,800.00 $  5,400.00
17a SP]Combination Air Valve and Manole 2 EA |$ 4,980.00 | $ 9,960.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 12,000.00
Base Bid Total $ 869,830.00 $ 886,000.00
Substitution Bid Items
1a SP]Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, E 1 EA No Bid | $ - No Bid | $ -
1b SP|10' x 10' Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA No Bid | $ - No Bid | $ -
Substitution Bid Total $ - $ -
Credit for Non-Award of ltems Base Bid 1a and 1b| None None
Bid with Substitution None None
TOTAL BID $ 869,830.00 $ 886,000.00
COMPLETION (days) 245 270
Lowest Bid $ 857,000.00
Award to Kirk Bros. Co.
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CITY OF BOWLING GREEN
PROJECTNAME:  Poe and Dunbridge Pump Station Replacement

BID DATE: February 25, 2010 E.R. Zeiler Excavating, Inc. Hanks Plumbing and Heating
Published Construction Estimate = $975,000 125 Substation Road 2000 The Bluffs
Temperance, Ml 48182 Toledo, OH 43615
BID OoDOT UNIT ITEM UNIT ITEM
ITEM REF. DESCRIPTION IQUANTITY] UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
NO. NO. BID BID BID BID
Base Bid Items
1a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, Eq 1 EA | $ 650,000.00 [ $ 650,000.00 | $ 625,000.00 [ $ 625,000.00
1b SP|10' x 10' Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA |$ 2500000 |$ 25000.00|% 15,000.00(¢$ 15,000.00
2a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station Abandonment 1 LS $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
3a 638]12" Dia. C-900 Sanitary Sewer Forcemain 1526 LF $ 3350 |$ 51,121.00 | $ 50.00 [ $ 76,300.00
3b SP]Connection of Forcemain to Grit Chamber 1 LS $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
3c SP|Termination of Existing 6" Forcemain 2 EA 1$ 450.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
4a 604 Wet Well Modifications 1 LS $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
4b 604]Sanitary Sewer Manhole, Type 3-4 1 EA |$ 1,850.00 | $ 1,850.00 [$  2,500.00 | $  2,500.00
5a 203|Pavement Excavation 273 CY 1% 18.00 | $ 4,914.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 4,095.00
5b 203|Subgrade Compaction 545 SY |$ 1.60 | $ 872.00 [ $ 1.00 | $ 545.00
5¢ 304|Aggregate Base 182 CY |$ 33.50 | $ 6,097.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 7,280.00
5d 301|Bituminous Aggregate Base 46 CYy 1% 210.00 [$  9,660.00 | $ 150.00 | $  6,900.00
5e 448|Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course 23 CY |$ 235.00 | $ 5,405.00 | $ 153.00 | $ 3,519.00
5f 448|Asphalt Concrete Surface Course 23 CYy 1% 260.00 [$  5,980.00 | $ 163.00 | $  3,749.00
59 407|Tack Coat 55 GAL | $ 350 | $ 19250 | $ 325($ 178.75
6a SPJ4" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 520 LF $ 1250 | $  6,500.00 | $ 6.00($  3,120.00
6b SP|4" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 9.65 | $ 24125 $ 8.00 [ $ 200.00
6c SPJ2" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 580 LF $ 10.15|$ 5887.00 | $ 3.00($ 1,740.00
6d SP|2" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 7751 % 193.75 | $ 5.00 [ $ 125.00
7a 604]Catch Basins, Type 4-1 2 EA |$ 930.00 | $ 1,860.00 | $ 1,000.00 [ $  2,000.00
8a 603]12" Storm Sewer, Type B 40 LF $ 40.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 1,600.00
8b 603] Connection to Existing Storm Sewer 1 LS $ 1,103.50 | $ 1,103.50 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00
8c 603]30" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 10 LF $ 365.00 | $ 3,650.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 2,500.00
8d 603]8" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 72 LF $ 3850 [$ 2,772.00 | $ 125.00 | $  9,000.00
8e 603]6" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 31 LF $ 26.00 | $ 806.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 3,720.00
8f 603|4" Drain Pipe, Type B 40 LF $ 26.00 [ $ 1,040.00 | $ 30.00 [ $ 1,200.00
8g 603|Field Tile Repair Smaller Than 12" 100 LF $ 15.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,000.00
9a 659] Seeding and Mulching, Including Topsoil 3730 SY 1% 450 |$ 16,785.00 | $ 1.00[$  3,730.00
10a SP|Flow Meter Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 15,000.00 [$ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 [ $ 15,000.00
10b SP|Bypass Manhole Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 8,500.00
11a 616|Water for Dust Control 6 MGAL | $ 50.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 60.00
12a 607]Fence, Type CL with Barbed Wire 70 LF $ 35.00 [$ 2,450.00 | $ 35.00 [$  2,450.00
12b 607]Gate, Type CL with Barbed Wire 1 EA $ 1,150.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00
12c SPJRemoval of Existing Fence Type CL with Barbed Wirg 70 LF $ 1250 | $ 875.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 700.00
13a 207|Silt Fence 460 LF $ 225($ 1,035.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 2,300.00
13b 207]Inlet Protection 2 EA |$ 100.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 250.00
13b 207| Temporary Construction Drive 1 LS $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 850.00
14a SP|Wet Well Rehabilitated 1 EA |$ 420000|$ 4,200.00($ 5,000.00$ 5,000.00
14b SP]Manhole Rehabilitated 2 EA $ 6,900.00 | $ 13,800.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 7,600.00
15a SP|Vactor Receiving Station 1 EA |$ 17,500.00 |$ 17,500.00 [ $ 50,000.00 [ $ 50,000.00
15a SP]Pipe Bollard 2 EA $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
16a 638]12-Inch Gate Valve and Box 3 EA |$ 236500|$ 7,095.00($ 2,000.00$  6,000.00
17a SP]Combination Air Valve and Manole 2 EA |$ 4,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 7,000.00
Base Bid Total $ 893,935.00 $ 896,911.75
Substitution Bid Items
1a SP]Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, E 1 EA No Bid | $ - No Bid | $ -
1b SP|10' x 10' Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA No Bid | $ - No Bid | $ -
Substitution Bid Total $ - $ -
Credit for Non-Award of ltems Base Bid 1a and 1b| None None
Bid with Substitution None None
TOTAL BID $ 893,935.00 $ 896,911.75
COMPLETION (days) 180 None Listed
Lowest Bid $ 857,000.00
Award to Kirk Bros. Co.
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CITY OF BOWLING GREEN

PROJECT NAME:

BID DATE:

Poe and Dunbridge Pump Station Replacement

February 25, 2010

Published Construction Estimate = $975,000

Marine Building Group, Inc.
201 W. Sophia St., Ste H

Maumee, OH 43537

Crestline Paving and Excavating (
1913 Nebraska Ave.

Toledo, OH 43607

BID OoDOT UNIT ITEM UNIT ITEM
ITEM REF. DESCRIPTION IQUANTITY] UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
NO. NO. BID BID BID BID
Base Bid Items
1a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, Eq 1 EA |$ 607,000.00 | $ 607,000.00 | $ 666,982.00 | $ 666,982.00
1b SP]10' x 10" Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA |$ 28,400.00 |$ 28,400.00|$ 25,000.00|$ 25,000.00
2a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station Abandonment 1 LS $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 [$ 17,000.00 | $ 17,000.00
3a 638]12" Dia. C-900 Sanitary Sewer Forcemain 1526 LF $ 59.00 [ $ 90,034.00 | $ 50.00 [ $ 76,300.00
3b SP]Connection of Forcemain to Grit Chamber 1 LS $ 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
3c SP|Termination of Existing 6" Forcemain 2 EA 1$ 3,250.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
4a 604 Wet Well Modifications 1 LS $ 4,400.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 700.00
4b 604]Sanitary Sewer Manhole, Type 3-4 1 EA |$ 200000|$ 2,000.00($ 2100.00 | $ 2,100.00
5a 203|Pavement Excavation 273 CY 1% 11.00 | $ 3,003.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 3,276.00
5b 203|Subgrade Compaction 545 SY |$ 200 ($ 1,090.00 | $ 5.00($ 2,725.00
5¢ 304|Aggregate Base 182 CY |$ 36.00 | $ 6,552.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 7,644.00
5d 301|Bituminous Aggregate Base 46 CYy 1% 178.00 |$ 8,188.00 | $ 188.00 | $ 8,648.00
5e 448|Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course 23 CY |$ 183.00 | $ 4,209.00 | $ 222.00 | $ 5,106.00
5f 448|Asphalt Concrete Surface Course 23 CYy 1% 208.00 [$  4,784.00 | $ 235.00 | $ 5,405.00
59 407|Tack Coat 55 GAL | $ 7.00 | $ 385.00 | $ 1.00 [ $ 55.00
6a SPJ4" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 520 LF $ 33.00 ($ 17,160.00 | $ 470($ 2,444.00
6b SP|4" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 36.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 150.00
6c SPJ2" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 580 LF $ 400($ 2,320.00 | $ 200 ($ 1,160.00
6d SP|2" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 6.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 420 $ 105.00
7a 604]Catch Basins, Type 4-1 2 EA |$ 750.00 [$ 1,500.00 | $  1,350.00 | $ 2,700.00
8a 603]12" Storm Sewer, Type B 40 LF $ 62.00 | $ 2,480.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 1,200.00
8b 603] Connection to Existing Storm Sewer 1 LS $ 9,500.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
8c 603]30" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 10 LF $ 580.00 | $ 5,800.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
8d 603]8" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 72 LF |$ 39.00 ($ 2,808.00 | $ 83.00 [ $ 5,976.00
8e 603]6" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 31 LF $ 54.00 | $ 1,674.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 2,480.00
8f 603|4" Drain Pipe, Type B 40 LF |$ 29.00 ($ 1,160.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 480.00
8g 603|Field Tile Repair Smaller Than 12" 100 LF $ 22.00 [ $ 2,200.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 2,500.00
9a 659| Seeding and Mulching, Including Topsoil 3730 SY |$ 180|$% 671400 $ 440($ 16,412.00
10a SP|Flow Meter Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 34,000.00$ 34,000.00|$ 30,000.00$ 30,000.00
10b SP|Bypass Manhole Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 14,000.00 [$ 14,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
11a 616|Water for Dust Control 6 MGAL | $ 210 $ 12.60 | $ 10.00 | $ 60.00
12a 607]Fence, Type CL with Barbed Wire 70 LF |$ 33.00($ 2,310.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 2,100.00
12b 607]Gate, Type CL with Barbed Wire 1 EA $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 999.00 | $ 999.00
12c SPJRemoval of Existing Fence Type CL with Barbed Wirg 70 LF $ 15.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 840.00
13a 207|Silt Fence 460 LF $ 215($ 989.00 | $ 2.00($ 920.00
13b 207|Inlet Protection 2 EA $ 4,050.00 | $ 8,100.00 | $ 112.00 | $ 224.00
13b 207| Temporary Construction Drive 1 LS $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 300.00
14a SP|Wet Well Rehabilitated 1 EA |$ 570000($ 5700.00|$  2,400.00 | $ 2,400.00
14b SP]Manhole Rehabilitated 2 EA $ 2,600.00 | $ 5,200.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 7,600.00
15a SP|Vactor Receiving Station 1 EA |$ 35000.00|$ 35000.00|$ 42,000.00|$ 42,000.00
15a SP]Pipe Bollard 2 EA $ 350.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 700.00
16a 638]12-Inch Gate Valve and Box 3 EA |$ 170000 ($ 5,100.00|$  2,100.00 | $ 6,300.00
17a SP]Combination Air Valve and Manole 2 EA |$ 4,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 8,400.00
Base Bid Total $ 952,872.60 $ 993,391.00
Substitution Bid Items
1a SP]Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, E 1 EA No Bid | $ - No Bid | $ -
1b SP|10' x 10' Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA No Bid | $ - No Bid | $ -
Substitution Bid Total $ - $ -
Credit for Non-Award of ltems Base Bid 1a and 1b| None None
Bid with Substitution None None
TOTAL BID $ 952,872.60 $ 993,391.00
COMPLETION (days) 260 270,
Lowest Bid $ 857,000.00
Award to Kirk Bros. Co.
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CITY OF BOWLING GREEN

PROJECT NAME:

BID DATE:

Poe and Dunbridge Pump Station Replacement

February 25, 2010

Published Construction Estimate = $975,000

PHC, Inc.
3611 King Road

Toledo, OH 43617

BID OoDOT UNIT ITEM
ITEM REF. DESCRIPTION IQUANTITY] UNIT PRICE TOTAL
NO. NO. BID BID
Base Bid Items
1a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, Eq 1 EA | $ 654,500.00 [ $ 654,500.00
1b SP|10' x 10' Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
2a SP|Sanitary Sewer Pump Station Abandonment 1 LS $ 10,000.00 [ $ 10,000.00
3a 638]12" Dia. C-900 Sanitary Sewer Forcemain 1526 LF $ 50.00 [ $ 76,300.00
3b SP]Connection of Forcemain to Grit Chamber 1 LS $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
3c SP|Termination of Existing 6" Forcemain 2 EA 1$ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00
4a 604|Wet Well Modifications 1 LS $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
4b 604]Sanitary Sewer Manhole, Type 3-4 1 EA 1$ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
5a 203|Pavement Excavation 273 CY 1% 25.00 [ $ 6,825.00
5b 203|Subgrade Compaction 545 SY |$ 1.00 [ $ 545.00
5¢ 304|Aggregate Base 182 CY |$ 40.00 | $ 7,280.00
5d 301|Bituminous Aggregate Base 46 CY |$ 180.00 | $ 8,280.00
5e 448|Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course 23 CY |$ 200.00 | $ 4,600.00
5f 448|Asphalt Concrete Surface Course 23 CY |$ 220.00 | $ 5,060.00
59 407|Tack Coat 55 GAL | $ 3.00 $ 165.00
6a SP|4" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 520 LF $ 5.00|$% 2,600.00
6b SP|4" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 6.00 | $ 150.00
6c SP|2" Schedule 40 PVC Underground Conduit 580 LF $ 2.00($ 1,160.00
6d SP|2" Schedule 80 PVC Underground Conduit 25 LF $ 5.00 [ $ 125.00
7a 604]Catch Basins, Type 4-1 2 EA |$ 750.00 | $ 1,500.00
8a 603]12" Storm Sewer, Type B 40 LF $ 30.00 | $ 1,200.00
8b 603] Connection to Existing Storm Sewer 1 LS $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
8c 603]30" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 10 LF $ 600.00 | $ 6,000.00
8d 603]8" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 72 LF $ 70.00 [ $ 5,040.00
8e 603]6" Sanitary Sewer, Type B 31 LF $ 65.00 | $ 2,015.00
8f 603|4" Drain Pipe, Type B 40 LF $ 30.00 [ $ 1,200.00
8g 603|Field Tile Repair Smaller Than 12" 100 LF $ 5.00 [ $ 500.00
9a 659]Seeding and Mulching, Including Topsoil 3730 SY |$ 1.00 [ $ 3,730.00
10a SP|Flow Meter Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 45,000.00$ 45,000.00
10b SP|Bypass Manhole Vault and Equipment 1 EA |$ 30,000.00 ($ 30,000.00
11a 616|Water for Dust Control 6 MGAL | $ 10.00 | $ 60.00
12a 607|Fence, Type CL with Barbed Wire 70 LF $ 30.00 [$  2,100.00
12b 607|Gate, Type CL with Barbed Wire 1 EA |$ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
12c SPJRemoval of Existing Fence Type CL with Barbed Wirg 70 LF $ 13.00 | $ 910.00
13a 207|Silt Fence 460 LF $ 250 | $ 1,150.00
13b 207]Inlet Protection 2 EA |$ 50.00 | $ 100.00
13b 207| Temporary Construction Drive 1 LS $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
14a SP|Wet Well Rehabilitated 1 EA |$ 5,00000|$ 5,000.00
14b SP|Manhole Rehabilitated 2 EA |$ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00
15a SP|Vactor Receiving Station 1 EA |$ 35,000.00|$ 35000.00
15a SP|Pipe Bollard 2 EA |$ 600.00 | $ 1,200.00
16a 638]12-Inch Gate Valve and Box 3 EA $ 2,200.00 | $ 6,600.00
17a SP]Combination Air Valve and Manole 2 EA |$ 5,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
Base Bid Total $ 997,895.00
Substitution Bid Items
1a SP]Sanitary Sewer Pump Station, Dry Well, Wet Well, E 1 EA No Bid | $ -
1b SP]10' x 10" Above Grade Fiberglass Enclosure 1 EA No Bid | $ -
Substitution Bid Total $ -
Credit for Non-Award of ltems Base Bid 1a and 1b| None
Bid with Substitution None
TOTAL BID $ 997,895.00
COMPLETION (days) 360
Lowest Bid $ 857,000.00
Award to Kirk Bros. Co.
Poe and Dunbridge Pump Station Bid Tab (02-23-10) Bid Tab 50f5

2/25/2010



