
CITY OF BOWLING GREEN
PROJECT NAME: Napoleon Rd and South College Dr. Sewer Improvements
BID DATE: June 11, 2209 Kokosing Construction Company, LLC Reynolds Inliner, LLC Miller Pipeline Corporation

Published Construction Estimate  =  $520,000 PO Box 226 4143 Weaver Court 8850 Crawfordsville Rd.

Fredericktown, OH 43019 Hilliard, OH 43026 Indianapolis, IN 46234

BID ODOT UNIT   ITEM UNIT   ITEM UNIT   ITEM

ITEM REF. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE   TOTAL PRICE   TOTAL PRICE   TOTAL

NO. NO. BID BID BID BID BID BID

Base Bid Items

1a SP 18-inch CIPP Pipeline Rehabilitation 1143 LF 48.00$                 54,864.00$             55.00$                 62,865.00$          56.00$                 64,008.00$          

1b SP 21-inch CIPP Pipeline Rehabilitation 2512 LF 50.00$                 125,600.00$           62.00$                 155,744.00$        64.00$                 160,768.00$        

1c SP Service Connection Reinstated 40 EA 180.00$               7,200.00$               140.00$               5,600.00$            125.00$               5,000.00$            

2a 603 6-inch Conduit 20 LF 18.09$                 361.80$                  20.00$                 400.00$               20.00$                 400.00$               

2b 603 8-inch Conduit 10 LF 30.04$                 300.40$                  33.00$                 330.00$               34.00$                 340.00$               

2c 603 10-inch Conduit 20 LF 32.16$                 643.20$                  35.00$                 700.00$               35.00$                 700.00$               

2d 603 15-inch Conduit 20 LF 67.16$                 1,343.20$               73.00$                 1,460.00$            75.00$                 1,500.00$            

2e 603 18-inch Conduit 50 LF 75.00$                 3,750.00$               81.00$                 4,050.00$            83.00$                 4,150.00$            

2f 603 21-inch Conduit 20 LF 117.76$               2,355.20$               128.00$               2,560.00$            130.00$               2,600.00$            

2g 603 6-inch Cleanout 4 EA 236.00$               944.00$                  255.00$               1,020.00$            260.00$               1,040.00$            

3a 604 Sanitary Sewer Manhole Removed 5 EA 2,007.28$            10,036.40$             2,168.00$            10,840.00$          2,225.00$            11,125.00$          

3b 604 Sanitary Sewer Manhole Type 3-4 3 EA 3,461.40$            10,384.20$             3,739.00$            11,217.00$          5,340.00$            16,020.00$          

3c 604 Sanitary Sewer Manhole Eliminated 1 EA 2,056.45$            2,056.45$               2,221.00$            2,221.00$            2,275.00$            2,275.00$            

4a SP Manhole Rehabilitated 16 EA 1,455.63$            23,290.08$             1,472.00$            23,552.00$          1,510.00$            24,160.00$          

5a 202 Asphalt Pavement Removal 50 SY 5.83$                   291.50$                  6.30$                   315.00$               7.00$                   350.00$               

5b 304 Aggregate Base 17 CY 36.49$                 620.33$                  40.00$                 680.00$               41.00$                 697.00$               

5c 448 Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, PG 64-22, Type 1 2 CY 528.00$               1,056.00$               571.00$               1,142.00$            585.00$               1,170.00$            

5d 448 Asphalt Intermediate Course, PG 64-22, Type 2 6 CY 352.00$               2,112.00$               381.00$               2,286.00$            390.00$               2,340.00$            

5e 407 Tack Coat, Intermediate and Surface Course 2.5 GAL 22.00$                 55.00$                    24.00$                 60.00$                 26.00$                 65.00$                 

5f 411 Berm - Crushed Aggregate 5 CY 39.27$                 196.35$                  43.00$                 215.00$               44.00$                 220.00$               

6a 202 Concrete Pavement Removal 50 SY 13.44$                 672.00$                  15.00$                 750.00$               15.00$                 750.00$               

6b 452 Plain Concrete Pavement (Class MS) 50 SY 57.76$                 2,888.00$               63.00$                 3,150.00$            64.00$                 3,200.00$            

7a 659 Seeding, Mulching and Top Soil 222 SY 10.27$                 2,279.94$               12.00$                 2,664.00$            12.00$                 2,664.00$            

8a 614 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS 9,000.00$            9,000.00$               1,041.00$            1,041.00$            12,500.00$          12,500.00$          

9a SP Bypass Pumping 1 LS 13,325.00$          13,325.00$             55,000.00$          55,000.00$          33,000.00$          33,000.00$          

Base Bid Total 275,625.05$           349,862.00$        351,042.00$        

Alternate Bid Items

10a-Alt SP 18-inch Fold and Form Pipeline Rehabilitation 1143 LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10b-Alt SP 21-inch Fold and Form Pipeline Rehabilitation 2512 LF No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10c-Alt SP Service Connection Reinstated 40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Alternate Bid Total No Bid No Bid No Bid

Credit for Non-Award of Items 1a, 1b, 1c No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid with Alternates No Bid No Bid No Bid

TOTAL BASE BID 275,625.05$           349,862.00$        351,042.00$        

COMPLETION (days) 120 120 120

Lowest Bid $275,625.05

Award to Kokosing Construction Company, LLC
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CITY OF BOWLING GREEN
PROJECT NAME: Napoleon Rd and South College Dr. Sewer Improvements
BID DATE: June 11, 2209

Published Construction Estimate  =  $520,000

BID ODOT

ITEM REF. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT

NO. NO.

Base Bid Items

1a SP 18-inch CIPP Pipeline Rehabilitation 1143 LF

1b SP 21-inch CIPP Pipeline Rehabilitation 2512 LF

1c SP Service Connection Reinstated 40 EA

2a 603 6-inch Conduit 20 LF

2b 603 8-inch Conduit 10 LF

2c 603 10-inch Conduit 20 LF

2d 603 15-inch Conduit 20 LF

2e 603 18-inch Conduit 50 LF

2f 603 21-inch Conduit 20 LF

2g 603 6-inch Cleanout 4 EA

3a 604 Sanitary Sewer Manhole Removed 5 EA

3b 604 Sanitary Sewer Manhole Type 3-4 3 EA

3c 604 Sanitary Sewer Manhole Eliminated 1 EA

4a SP Manhole Rehabilitated 16 EA

5a 202 Asphalt Pavement Removal 50 SY

5b 304 Aggregate Base 17 CY

5c 448 Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, PG 64-22, Type 1 2 CY

5d 448 Asphalt Intermediate Course, PG 64-22, Type 2 6 CY

5e 407 Tack Coat, Intermediate and Surface Course 2.5 GAL

5f 411 Berm - Crushed Aggregate 5 CY

6a 202 Concrete Pavement Removal 50 SY

6b 452 Plain Concrete Pavement (Class MS) 50 SY

7a 659 Seeding, Mulching and Top Soil 222 SY

8a 614 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS

9a SP Bypass Pumping 1 LS

Base Bid Total

Alternate Bid Items

10a-Alt SP 18-inch Fold and Form Pipeline Rehabilitation 1143 LF

10b-Alt SP 21-inch Fold and Form Pipeline Rehabilitation 2512 LF

10c-Alt SP Service Connection Reinstated 40 EA

Alternate Bid Total

Credit for Non-Award of Items 1a, 1b, 1c

Bid with Alternates

TOTAL BASE BID

COMPLETION (days)

Lowest Bid $275,625.05

Award to Kokosing Construction Company, LLC

Anderzack-Pitzen Construction, Inc.

424 East Main St.

Metamora, OH 43540

UNIT   ITEM

PRICE   TOTAL

BID BID

55.00$                 62,865.00$          

65.00$                 163,280.00$        

60.00$                 2,400.00$            

8.00$                   160.00$               

20.00$                 200.00$               

25.00$                 500.00$               

50.00$                 1,000.00$            

50.00$                 2,500.00$            

120.00$               2,400.00$            

400.00$               1,600.00$            

3,000.00$            15,000.00$          

12,500.00$          37,500.00$          

3,500.00$            3,500.00$            

1,650.00$            26,400.00$          

5.00$                   250.00$               

30.00$                 510.00$               

500.00$               1,000.00$            

350.00$               2,100.00$            

25.00$                 62.50$                 

100.00$               500.00$               

10.00$                 500.00$               

56.00$                 2,800.00$            

3.50$                   777.00$               

3,500.00$            3,500.00$            

36,695.50$          36,695.50$          

368,000.00$        

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

368,000.00$        
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