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BID TABULATION
Bowiing Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1072-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:.00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

CBI Constructors, Inc.
14109 South Route 59
Plainfield, lllinois 60544

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowiing Green, Ohio 43402

Ref. No. Description Estimated
Quantity  Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

A1 New 1,500,000 Galion Stee! Fiuted Column
Elevated Tank, Including All Associated Work
Specified, Foundation, Mixer, Painting,

Allowances, and All Other Specified Work 1 LS. Ne Bid No Bid $3,342,885.00 $3,342,889.00
A2 Connections to Existing Waterline. 110 L.F. No Bid Na Bid $190.00 $20,900.00
A3 16" Butterfly Valve, Complete in Manhole 3  Each No Bid No Bid $6,755.00 $20,265.00
Ad Fire Hydrant Assembly, Complete with All Fiftings

and Watch Valve with Valve Box 1 Each No Bid No Bid $5,700.00 $5,700.00
A5 Manhole to Basin, Including Granular Backfill and 150 L.F. No Bid No Bid $61.00 $9,150.00
AB New Storm Manhole Constructed Over Existing 21 1 Each No Bid No Bid $3,500.00 $3,800.00
A7 New ODOT 2-2-B Storm Inlet on 15" Storm Line 1  Each No Bid No Bid $1,400.00 $1,400.00
A8 Grading, Seeding and Mulching 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $24,346.00 $24,346.00
AB Asphalt Road Patch, Complete with Subbase and 5C 3Y. No Bid No Bid $49.00 $2,450.00
A10 Electrical Work and Telemetry, Including Power 1 1.8, No Bid No Bid $136,000.00 $136,000.00
A11 Mobilization 1 LS No Bid No Bid $150,000.00 $150,000.00
A12 Bid Bond 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $20,000.00 $20,000.00

CORRECTED OFTION A BASE BID PRICE

QOPTION A BASE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED No Bid $3,737,000.00

ALTERNATE BID ITEMS FOR OPTION "A" - STEEL FLUTED COLUMN TANK
AlA Alternate Exterior Coating - Add to Opticn "A"

Base Bid Price 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $51,000.00 $51,000.00
A2A Alternate Interior Wet Coating - Add to Option "A"
Base Bid Price 1 LS. Nc Bid No Bid $3,000.00 $3,000.00

A3A Alternate bid item to replace heat tracing and

replace it with an insufated and heated room that

is BX15'X8' tall. Provide materials of

construction. 1 LS. Nec Bid Ne Bid $3,000.00 $3,000.00
AdA Deduct Alternate for Extended Completion Date -

Substantial, July 31, 2015 & Final August 30,

2015 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $53,000.00 $53,000.00
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BiD TABULATION
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number; 1072-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Poggemeyer Desigh Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

CBI Constructors, Inc.

14109 South Route 59
Plainfieid, Hlinocis 60544

Ref. No. Description Estimated
Quantity  Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
QOPTION "B" - BASE BiD
B1 New 1,500,000 Gallon Composite Concrete 1 LS $2,925000.00 $2,925,000.00 $3,092,889.00  $3,092,885.00
B2 Connections to Existing Waterline, 110 L.F. $200.00 $22,000.00 $190.00 $20,3800.00
B3 16" Butterfly Valve, Compiete in Manhole 3 Each $7,000.00 $21,000.00 $6,755.00 $20,265.00
B4 Fire Hydrant Assembly, Complete with All Fittings
and Waich Valve with Valve Box 1 Each $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,700.00 $5,700.00
B5 15" PVC Storm Line, installed fo Grade from
Manhole to Basin, Including Granular Backfill and
Compactian. 150 LF. $60.00 $9,000.00 $61.00 $9,150.00
B6 New Storm Manhole Constructed Over Existing 21 1 Each $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00
B7 New ODOT 2-2-B Storm Inlet on 15" Storm Line 1 Each $2,000.00 $2.000.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00
B8 Site Restoration - including Asphalt Drive,
Grading, Seeding and Mulching 1 LS. $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $24,346.00 $24 346.00
B9 Asphalt Road Patch, Complete with Subbase and » 50 8Y. $60.00 $3,000.00 $49.00 $2.450.00
B1G Electrical Work and Telemetry, Including Power
Connection, Controls, Pressure Transmitter,
Intrusion Alarms, and Teiemetry Panel to Connect
to Existing WTP Controls 1 L.S. $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $136,000.00 $136,000.00
B11 Mobilization 1 LS. $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00
Bi2 Bid Bond 1 L.S. $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
CORRECTED CPTION B BASE BID PRICE
OPTION B BASE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED $3,225.00000 $3,487,000.00
ALTERNATE BID ITEMS FOR OPTION "B" - COMPOSITE CONCRETE COLUMN WELDED STEEL TANK
B1A  Alternate Exterior Coating - Add to Option "B"
Base Bid Price i LS. ' $26,000.00 $26,000.00
B2A Alternate Interior Wet Coating - Add to Option "B"
Base Bid Price i LS. )0 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
B3A Bid Price 1 L.S. $45,006.00 $12.,000.00 $12,000.00
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BID TABULATION
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1072-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowiing Green, Ohio 43402

Ref. No. Description Estimated

Quantity

Unit

Unit Price

CBI Constructors, Inc.
14109 South Route 59
Plainfield, lHlinois 680544

Total Price Linit Price Total Price

B4A Windows in Concrete Column as Shown in the
Drawings - Add to Option "B" Base Bid Price

BSA Alternate bid item to replace heat tracing and
replace it with an insufated and heated room that
is 8'X15'X8" {all. Provide materials of
censtruction.

BBA Deduct Alternate for Extended Completion Date -
Substantial, July 31, 2015 & Final August 30,
2015

Alternate Bid fems - ALTERNATE BID ITEMS
BELOW MAY BE SELECTED BY THE OWNER
EVEN IF THIS CHANGES THE CONTRACT
AWARD FOR THE PROJECT FOR OPTION "A"
AND OPTION "B".

K Mixers to be [nstalled in Existing Elevated Water
Storage Tanks as Directed. Mixers Shall be the
Same as the Mixer Installed in the New Elevated
Water Storage Tank. Existing Tanks are the
Same Size as the Proposed Tank.

2 Fencing Site Perimeter, 8' Tall with 3 Strands of
Barbed Wire on Top (135" X 175" with 1 Man Gate
and 1 - 20' Gate) per ODOT Iltem 807 with Black
Vinyt Coating

CONTRACT 2 - TANK DEMOLITION

C1 Demolition of Existing 500,000 Gallen Manville
Elevated Water Storage Tank and Associated
Work. Remove Existing Multi-Leg Tank and Site
Fence, Disconnect Waterline from Existing City
Watermain, Removal of Existing Foundation, and
Grading Site and Reseeding.

12

2

Each

LS.

LS.

Each

LS.

L.&.

$3,200.00

$35,000.0

-$70,000.00

$175,000.00

$25,000.00

No Bid

$38,400.00 $5,000.00 $60,000.00

$3,000.00 $3.000.00

-$111,000.00 -$111,000.00

$350,000.00 No Bid No Bid

$25,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00

No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
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BID TABULATIUN
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1672-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

CBI Constructers, Inc.
14109 South Route 59
Plainfield, lllinois 60544

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowling Green, Chio 43402

Ref. No. Description Estimated
Quantity  Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

c2 Demolition of existing 500,000 Gallen Haskins
Road Elevated Water Storage Tank and
Associated Work., Remove Existing Fluted
Column Tank, Disconnect Wateriine from Existing
City Watermain, Removal of Existing Foundation
and Site :Lighting, and Grading Site and
Reseeding. 1 LS. No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid

CORRECTED CONTRACT 2 BID PRICE
CONTRACT 2 BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED No Bid No Bid

COMBINATION BIDS

TOTAL CONTRACT 1 - OPTION "A” AND CONTRACT 2 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL CONTRACT 1 - OPTION 'B" AND CONTRACT 2 No Bid No Bid
BID BOND Yes Yes

OPTION B BASE BID & ALT B1A, B2A, B5A,
and B6A

$3,407,500.00
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BID TABULATILN
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1072-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Phoenix Fabricators & Erectors, Inc.
182 South County Road 900 East
Avon, Indiana 46123

Caldwell Tanks, Inc.
4000 Tower Read
Louisville, Kentucky 40219

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

Ref. No. Description Estimated
Quantity  Unit tnit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

OPTION "A" BASE BID
Al New 1,500,000 Galion Steei Fluted Column

Elevated Tank, Including All Asscociated Work

Specified, Foundatien, Mixer, Painting,

Ailowances, and All Other Specified Work 1 LS. $4,304,500.00 $4,304 500.00 No Bid No Bid
A2 Conneactions to Existing Waterline. 110 L.F. $250.00 $27,500.00 No Bid Mo Bid
A3 16" Butterfly Valve, Complete in Manhole 3 Each $15,000.00 $45,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Ad Fire Hydrant Assembly, Complete with All Fittings

and Watch Valve with Valve Box 1 Each $7.000.00 $7,000.00 No Bid No Bid
A3 Manhoie to Basin, Including Granular Backfill and 150 L.F. $150.00 $22,500.00 Ne¢ Bid No Bid
AB New Storm Manhole Constructed Over Existing 21 1 Each $7,000.00 $7,000.00 Ne Bid No Bid
A7 New OPOT 2-2-B Storm Inlet on 15" Storm Line 1 Each $4,000.00 $4,000.00 No Bid No Bid
A8 Grading, Seeding and Mulching 1 LS. $30,000.00 $50,000.00 No Bid No Bid
AG Asphalt Road Patch, Complete with Subbase and 50 SY. $250.00 $12,500.00 No Bid No Bid
A10 Electrical Work and Telemetry, Including Power 1 LS. $150,000.00 $150,000.00 No Bid Mo Bid
A1l Mobilization 1 LS. $20,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid No Bid
A12 Bid Bond 1 LS. $20,G00.00 $20,000.00 No Bid No Bid

CORRECTED OPTION A BASE BID PRICE

OPTION A BASE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED $4,700,000.00 No Bid

ALTERNATE BID ITEMS FOR OPTION "A” - STEEL FLUTED COLUMI
Al1A Alternate Exterior Coating - Add to Option "A”

Base Bid Price 1 .S, $50,000.00 $50,000.00 Ne Bid No Bid
AZA Alternate Interior Wet Coating - Add to Option "A"

Base Bid Price 1 L.S. $2,000.00 $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid
A3A Alternate bid item to replace heat tracing and

replace it with an insulated and heated room that

is 8'X15'X8" tall. Provide materials of

construction. 1 £.S. $20,000.00 $20,000.00 No Bid No Bid
ALA Peduct Alternate for Extended Completion Date -

Substantial, July 31, 2015 & Final August 30,

2015 1 L.S. $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid
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BID TABULATION
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1072-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

Caidwell Tanks, Inc.
4000 Tower Road

Louisville, Kentucky 40219

Phoenix Fabricators & Erectors, Inc.
182 South County Road 900 East

Avon, Indiana 46123

Ref. No. Description Estimated
Quantity  Unit tnit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

OPTION "B" - BASE BID
B1 New 1,500,000 Gallor Composite Concrete 1 .S, $3,544,500.00 $3,544,500.00 $3,935,589.00 $3,935,589.00
B2 Connections to Existing Waterline. 110 L.F. $250.00 $27.,500.00 $190.00 $20,900.00
B3 18" Butterfly Valve, Complete in Manhole 3 Each $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $8,000.00 $24,000.00
B4 Fire Hydrant Assembly, Complete with All Fittings

and Watch Valve with Valve Box 1 Each $7,000.00 $7.000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00
B5 15" PVC Storm Line, installed to Grade from

Manhole to Basin, Including Granular Backfill and

Compaction. 150 LF. $150.00 $22,500.00 $70.00 $10,500.00
BB New Storm Manhole Constructed Over Existing 21 1 Each $7.000.00 $7,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
B7 New ODOT 2-2-B Storm Inlet on 15" Storm Line 1  Each $4.,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00
B3 Site Restoration - including Asphalt Drive,

Grading, Seeding and Mulching 1 L.S. $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
B9 Asphait Road Patch, Complete with Subbase and , 50 8. $250.00 $12,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00
B10 Electrical Work and Telemetry, including Power

Connecticn, Controls, Pressure Transmitter,

Intrusicn Alarms, and Telemetry Panel to Connect

to Existing WTP Controls 1 l.8. $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00
B11 Mobilization 1 LS. $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00
B12 Bid Bond 1 LS. $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $200.00 $200.00

CORRECTED OPTION B BASE BID PRICE

OPTION B BASE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED $3,935,000.00 $4,210,689.00

ALTERNATE BID iTEMS FOR OPTION "B" - COMPOSITE CONCRETE
B1A Alternate Exterior Coating - Add {o Option "B"

Base Bid Price 1 LS. $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $52,942.00 $52,942 00
B2A Alternata Interior Wet Coating - Add to Option "B"

Base Bid Price 1 LS. $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $15,820.00 $15,820.00
B3A Bid Price 4 L.S. $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $77,205.00 $77.,205.00
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BID TABULATION
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1072-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowiing Green, Ohio 43402

Ref. No.

Pescription

Estimated
Quantity

Unit

Caldwell Tanks, Inc.
4000 Tower Road
Louisville, Kentucky 40219

Unit Price

Total Price

Phoenix Fabricators & Erectors, Inc.
182 South County Road 800 East
Avon, Indiana 46123

Unit Price Tatal Price

B4A

BSA

BEA

Ct

Windows in Concrete Column as Shown in the
Drawings - Add to Option "B" Base Bid Price
Alternate bid item to replace heat tracing and
replace it with an insutated and heated room that
is 8X15'X8" tall. Provide materials of
construction.

Deduct Alternate for Exiended Completion Date -
Substantial, July 31, 2015 & Final August 30,
2015

Alternate Bid ltems - ALTERNATE BID ITEMS
BELOW MAY BE SELECTED BY THE OWNER
EVEN iF THIS CHANGES THE CONTRACT
AWARD FOR THE PROJECT FOR OPTION "A"
AND OPTION "B".

Mixers to be Instailed in Existing Elevated Water
Storage Tanks as Directed. Mixers Shall be the
Same as the Mixer Installed in the New Elevated
Water Storage Tank. Existing Tanks are the
Same Size as the Proposed Tank.

Fencing Site Perimeter, &' Tall with 3 Strands of
Barbed Wire on Top {135 X 175" with 1 Man Gate
and 1 - 20' Gate} per ODQOT item 807 with Black
Vinyl Coating

CONTRACT 2 - TANK DEMOLITION

Demolition of Existing 500,000 Gallon Manville
Elevated Water Storage Tank and Associated
Work. Remove Existing Multi-Leg Tank and Site
Fence, Disconnect Waterline from Existing City
Watermain, Removal of Existing Foundation, and
Grading Site and Reseeding.

12

Each

L3,

L.S.

Each

L.S.

LS.

$1,500.00

$20,000.00

$0.00

$75,000.00

$20,000.00

$50,000.00

$18,000.00

$20,000.00

$0.00

$150,000.00

$20,000.00

$50,000.00

$3,000.00 $36.000.00

$24,720.00 $24,720.00

-$280,000.00 -$280,000.00

$146,764.50 $293,529.0C

$27,349.00

$27,349.00

No Bid No Bid
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BiD TABULATION
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1072-002

Bids Received; Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

Ref. No. Description Estimated
Quantity  Unit

Caldwell Tanks, Inc.
4000 Tower Road
Louisville, Kentucky 40219

Unit Price Total Price

Phoenix Fabricators & Erectors, Inc.
182 South County Road 900 East

Avon, Indiana 46123

Unit Price

Total Price

C2 Demolition of existing 500,000 Gallen Haskins
Road Elevated Water Storage Tank and
Associated Work. Remove Existing Fluted
Column Tank, Disconnect Waterline from Existing
City Watermain, Removal of Existing Foundation
and Site :Lighting, and Grading Site and
Reseeding. 1 LS.

CORRECTED CONTRACT 2 BID PRICE
CONTRACT 2 BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED

COMBINATION BIDS

TOTAL CONTRACT 1 - OPTION "A" AND CONTRACT 2
TOTAL CONTRACT 1 - OPTION 'B' AND CONTRACT 2
BID BOND

OPTION B BASE BID & ALT B1A, B2A, B5A,
and B6A

$50,000.00 $50,000.00

$100,000.00

%4 ,800,000.00
$4,035,000.00
Yes

$4,007,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid
Yes

$4,024,171.00
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BID TABULATION
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1072-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

Ref. No. Description Estimated
Quantity  Unit Unit Price Total Price Average

OPTION "A" BASE BID

At New 1,500,000 Gallon Steel Fluted Column
Elevated Tank, Including Ail Associated Work
Specified, Foundation, Mixer, Painting,

Allowances, and All Other Specified Work 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $3,823,694.50
AZ Connections to Existing Waterline. 110 LF. No Bid No Bid $220.00
A3 16" Butterfiy Valve, Complete in Manhole 3 Each No Bid No Bid $10,877.50
Ad Fire Hydrant Assembly, Compiete with Al Fittings

and Watch Valve with Valve Box 1  Each No Bid No Bid $6,350.00
A5 Manhole to Basin, Including Granufar Backfiil and 150 L.F. No Bid No Bid $105.50
AB New Storm Manhole Constructed Over Existing 21 1 Each No Bid No Bid $5,450.00
A7 New ODOT 2-2-B Storm Inlet on 15" Storm Line 1 Each No Bid No Bid $2,700.00
A8 Grading, Seading and Mulching 1 L.S. No Bid No Bid $52,173.00
A9 Asphalt Road Patch, Complete with Subbase and, 50 SY. No Bid No Bid $149.50
A10 Electrical Work and Telemetry, Including Power 1 L.S. No Bid No Bid $143,000.00
At Mahbilization 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $85,000.00
At2 Bid Bond 1 LS. Na Bid No Bid $20,000.00

CORRECTED CPTION A BASE BiD PRICE

OPTION A BASE BiD PRICE AS SUBMITTED No Bid

ALTERNATE BID ITEMS FOR OPTION "A" - STEEL FLUTED COLUM!I
Al1A Alternate Extericr Coating - Add to Option "A"

Base Bid Price 1 L.S. No Bid No Bid $50,500.00
AZA Alternate Interior Wet Coating - Add io Option "A"

Base Bid Price 1 .S, No Bid No Bid $2,500.00
A3A Alternate bid item to replace heat tracing and

replace it with an insulated and heated room that

is 8X15'X8" tall. Provide materials of

construction. 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $11,500.00
AdA Deduct Alternate for Extended Completion Date -

Substantial, July 31, 2015 & Final August 30,

2015 1 LS.
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BID TABULATION
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number; 1072-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Poggemeyer Design Group, inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

Ref. No. Description Estimated
Quantity  Unit Unit Price Total Price Average

OPTION "B" - BASE BID

B1 New 1,500,000 Gallor Composite Concrete 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $3,374,494 50
B2 Connections to Existing Waterline, 110 L.F. No Bid No Bid $207.50
B3 16" Butterfly Valve, Complete in Manhole 3 Each No Bid No Bid $9,188.75
B4 Fire Hydrant Assembly, Complete with All Fittings

and Watch Valve with Valve Box 1 Each No Bid No Bid $6,175.00
B5 15" PVC Storm Line, installed to Grade from

Marhole to Basin, including Granutar Backfill and

Compaction, 150 L.F. No Bid No Bid £85.25
B6 New Storm Manhcle Constructed Over Existing 21 1 Each No Bid No Bid $4,850.00
B7 New OQDOT 2-2-B Storm Inlet on 15" Storm Line 1 Each No Bid No Bid $2,225.00
B8 Site Resteration - including Asphalt Drive,

Grading, Seeding and Mulching 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $38,586.50
Bg Asphalt Road Patch, Complete with Subbase and 50 SY. No Bid No Bid $102.25
B10 Electrical Work and Telemetry, Including Power

Connection, Contrals, Pressure Transmitter,
tntrusion Alarms, and Telemetry Panel to Connect

to Existing WTP Controls 1 L.S. Ne Bid No Bid $144,000.00
B11 Mobilization 1 ..S. No Bid No Bid $62,000.00
B12 Bid Bond 1 L.S. No Bid No Bid $13,800.00

CORRECTED OPTION B BASE BID PRICE
OPTION B BASE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED No Bid

ALTERNATE BIiD ITEMS FOR OPTION "B” - COMPOSITE CONCRETE
B1A Alternate Exterior Coating - Add to Option "B"

Base Bid Price 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $47,235.50
B2A Alternate Intericr Wet Coating ~ Add to Option "B"
Base Bid Price 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $6,330.00

B3A Bid Price 1 LS. No Bid No Bid $38,551.25
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BIB TABULATION
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1072-092

Bids Received; Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

Ref. No. Description Estimated
Quantity  Unit

Unit Price

Total Price

Average

B4A Windows in Concrete Column as Shown in the

Prawings - Add to Option "B" Base Bid Price 12  Each
B5A Alternate bid ifem to replace heat tracing and

replace it with an insulated and heated room that

is 8'X15'X8" tall. Provide materials of

construction, 1 LS.
BSA Deduct Alternate for Extended Completion Date -

Substantial, July 31, 2015 & Final August 30,

2015 1 LS.

Alternate Bid {tems - ALTERNATE BID ITEMS

BELOW MAY BE SELECTED BY THE OWNER

EVEN IF THIS CHANGES THE CONTRACT

AWARD FOR THE PROJECT FOR OPTION "A"

AND OPTION "B".
1 Mixers to be Instalied in Existing Elevated Water

Storage Tanks as Directed. Mixers Shall be the

Same as the Mixer Installed in the New Elevated

Water Storage Tank. Existing Tanks are the

Same Size as the Proposed Tank. 2 Each
2 Fencing Site Perimeter, §' Taill with 3 Strands of

Barbed Wire on Top (135" X 175" with 1 Man Gate

and 1 - 20" Gate) per ODOT Hem 607 with Black

Vinyl Coating 1 LS.

CONTRACT 2 - TANK DEMOLITION
C1 Demolition of Existing 500,000 Galion Manville
Elevated Waier Storage Tank and Associated
Work. Remove Existing Multi-Leg Tank and Site
Fence, Disconnect Waterline from Existing City
Watermain, Remeval of Existing Foundation, and
Grading Site and Reseeding. 1 LS.

No Bid

No Bid

Ne Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$43,700.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$43,700.00

$3,175.00

$20,680.00

-$115,250.00

$132,254.83

$23,587.25

$46,850.00
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BID TABULATIUN.
Bowling Green 1.5 MG Elevated Water Storage Tank Improvements
Job Number: 1072-092

Bids Received: Friday, May 17, 2013 at 2:00 p.m.
Engineer's Estimate: $3,400,000

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.
1168 North Main Street
Bowling Green, Chio 43402

Ref. No. Description Estirnated
Quantity

Unit

Unit Price

Total Price

Average

c2 Demolition of existing 500,000 Gallon Haskins
Road Elevated Water Storage Tank and
Associated Work. Remove Existing Fluted
Column Tank, Disconnect Waterline from Existing
City Watermain, Removal of Existing Foundation
and Site :Lighting, and Grading Site and
Reseeding. 1

CORRECTED CONTRACT 2 BID PRICE
CONTRACT 2 BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED

COMBINATION BIDS

TOTAL CONTRACT 1 - OPTION "A" AND CONTRACT 2
TOTAL CONTRACT 1 - GPTION 'B' AND CONTRACT 2
BID BOND

OPTION B BASE BID & ALT B1A, B2A, B5A,
and BBA

LS

$45,200.00

$45,200.00

No Bid

$68,900.00

No Bid
No Bid
Yes

$47.600.00



