
BID TABULATION: 2014 PAVING PROGRAM

10/24/2014

Engineer's Estimate:  $405,000

REF. ODOT TOTAL TOTAL

NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE BID PRICE UNIT PRICE BID PRICE

BASE BID

0001 202 Curb & Gutter Removed, As Per Plan 650.000 FT $12.00 $7,800.00 $12.00 $7,800.00

0002 202 Curb Removed, As Per Plan 100.000 FT $11.50 $1,150.00 $11.50 $1,150.00

0003 202

Pavement Removed (for Full Depth Pavement 

Repair) 244.000 SY $10.00 $2,440.00 $16.00 $3,904.00

0004 203

Excavation (18" for Full Depth Pavement 

Repair) 122.000 CY $36.00 $4,392.00 $34.00 $4,148.00

0005 204

Subgrade Compaction (for Full Depth 

Pavement Repair) 244.000 SY $2.00 $488.00 $0.50 $122.00

0006 254 Pavement Planing, 1.5" 11,111.000 SY $1.25 $13,888.75 $1.70 $18,888.70

0007 254 Pavement Planing, 2" 3,948.000 SY $1.25 $4,935.00 $2.40 $9,475.20

0008 254

Pavement Planing, Full Depth (Approximately 

3") 802.000 SY $2.50 $2,005.00 $5.35 $4,290.70

0009 254

Pavement Planing, Full Depth (Approximately 

3.5") 5,938.000 SY $2.00 $11,876.00 $2.70 $16,032.60

0010 301

Bituminous Aggregate Base (for Curb & 

Gutter Replacement) 2.000 CY $290.00 $580.00 $375.00 $750.00

Aggregate Base (for Full Depth Pavement 

LOWEST BID

1700 Fostoria Ave, Suite 200 9072 County Road 424

The Shelly Company Gerken Paving, Inc

0011 304

Aggregate Base (for Full Depth Pavement 

Repair) 122.000 CY $50.00 $6,100.00 $50.00 $6,100.00

0012 411

Stabilized Crushed Aggregate, Variable 

Thickness (2" Average) 374.000 CY $50.00 $18,700.00 $30.00 $11,220.00

0013 442

Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, 12.5 mm, 

Type A, (448) 282.000 CY $180.00 $50,760.00 $165.00 $46,530.00

0014 442

Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course, 19 mm 

, Type A (448) 330.000 CY $135.00 $44,550.00 $144.00 $47,520.00

0015 441

Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, Type 1, PG 

64-22 (448) 626.000 CY $165.00 $103,290.00 $158.00 $98,908.00

0016 441

Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course, Type 

2, PG 64-22 (448) 45.000 CY $145.00 $6,525.00 $185.00 $8,325.00

0017 441

Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Scratch 

Course, Type 1, PG 64-22 (448) 378.000 CY $158.00 $59,724.00 $167.00 $63,126.00

0018 407 Tack Coat for Surface Course 901.000 GAL $2.00 $1,802.00 $2.00 $1,802.00

0019 407

Tack Coat for Intermediate Course or Scratch 

Course 1,066.000 GAL $2.00 $2,132.00 $2.00 $2,132.00

0020 638 Valve Box Adjusted to Grade, As Per Plan 6.000 EA $525.00 $3,150.00 $300.00 $1,800.00

0021 811 Manhole Adjusted to Grade, As Per Plan 5.000 EA $875.00 $4,375.00 $1,100.00 $5,500.00

0022 811 Curb Inlet Adjusted to Grade 19.000 EA $825.00 $15,675.00 $825.00 $15,675.00

0023 609 Curb, Type 6 100.000 LF $19.00 $1,900.00 $24.00 $2,400.00
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0024 609 Curb & Gutter, Type 2 550.000 LF $24.00 $13,200.00 $27.00 $14,850.00

0025 609 Curb & Gutter, Type 3 100.000 LF $24.00 $2,400.00 $53.00 $5,300.00

0026 410 Traffic Compacted Surface, Type A or B 50.000 CY $45.00 $2,250.00 $35.00 $1,750.00

0027 614 Maintaining Traffic 1.000 LS $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

0028 614 Law Enforcement Officer with Patrol Car 8.000 HR $50.00 $400.00 $80.00 $640.00

0029 616 Water 3.000 MGAL $10.00 $30.00 $12.00 $36.00

0030 642 Center Line, Type 1 0.620 MI $3,000.00 $1,860.00 $3,000.00 $1,860.00

0031 642 Lane Line, Type 1 0.060 MI $3,000.00 $180.00 $3,000.00 $180.00

0032 644 Crosswalk Line, 12" 85.000 FT $5.00 $425.00 $5.00 $425.00

0033 644 Crosswalk Line, 24" x 6', As Per Plan 246.000 FT $8.00 $1,968.00 $8.00 $1,968.00

0034 644 Stop Line 36.000 FT $11.00 $396.00 $11.00 $396.00

0035 659 Seeding, Mulching, & Topsoil, APP 250.000 SY $6.75 $1,687.50 $6.75 $1,687.50

0036 441

Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Repair Course, 

Type 2, PG 64-22 (448) 14.000 CY $300.00 $4,200.00 $250.00 $3,500.00

TOTAL BASE BID AMOUNT $427,234.25 $445,191.70

ADD ALTERNATE A - ASPHALT REJUVENATING AGENT

A-1 SPEC ASPHALT REJUVENATING AGENT, APP 20,156.000 SY $0.85 $17,132.60 $0.85 $17,132.60

TOTAL ADD ALTERNATE A BID AMOUNT $17,132.60 $17,132.60

ADD/DEDUCT ALTERNATE B - DEC. 31, 2014 PROJECT COMPLETION DATE

B-1 SPEC

WORK TO BE COMPLETED BY DECEMBER 

31, 2014 0001 LS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE A $444,366.85 $462,324.30

(CIRCLE ONE)                                 ADD/DEDUCT ALTERNATE B 

AMOUNT            
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